North Central Texas
Council of Governments

Recommended Amendments to the
2021 International Plumbing Code
North Central Texas Council of Governments Region

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Plumbing Code are hereby
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IPC. Underlined type is text inserted. Lined-through
type-is-deleted-textfrom-the lPC. A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment
carried over from the 2018 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised amendment
with the 2021 edition of the code.

Note: Historically NCTCOG has limited Chapter 1 amendments in order to allow each city to insert their
local policies and procedures. We now have suggested certain items to be brought to the attention of
cities considering adoption of the code that may be of concern to several jurisdictions. It is still intended
to be discretionary to each city to determine which Chapter 1 amendments to include.

***Table of Contents, Chapter 7, Section 713; change to read as follows:

44-713  Engineered Computerized Drainage Design ... .. .............. 69-7-12

(Reason: Editorial change to make compatible with amendment to Section 714.1.)
***Section 102.8; change to read as follows:

102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be
those that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be
considered as part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference.
Where the differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the
provisions of this code shall be the minimum requirements. Whenever amendments have been adopted
to the referenced codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to
reference the adopted amendments. Any reference to NFPA 70 shall mean the National Electrical Code

as adopted.

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced
codes.)

***Section 305; change to read as follows:

305.1 Protection against contact. Metallic piping, except for cast iron, ductile iron and galvanized steel,
shall not be placed in direct contact with steel framing members, concrete or cinder walls and floors or
other masonry. Metallic piping shall not be placed in direct contact with corrosive soil. Where sheathing is
used to prevent direct contact, the sheathing shall have a thickness of not less than 0.008 inch (8 mil)
(0.203 mm) and the sheathing shall be made of approved material plastic. Where sheathing protects
piping that penetrates concrete or masonry walls or floors, the sheathing shall be installed in a manner
that allows movement of the piping within the sheathing.

(Reason: Allows for other materials to be accepted.)

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September
2018-Amendments 2048 2021 International Plumbing Code



**Section 305.4.1; changed to read as follows:

305.4.1 Sewer depth.

sewers shall be a minimum of 12 inches

(Reason: Provides sewer depth that is common in this region. Deleted reference to private sewage
disposal because a private sewage disposal code is not typically adopted in this region.)

***Section 306.2.4; added to read as follows:

***306.2.4 Plastic sewer and DWV piping installation. Plastic sewer and DWV piping installed
underground shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Trench
width shall be controlled to not exceed the outside the pipe diameter plus 16 inches or in a trench which
has a controlled width equal to the nominal diameter of the diameter of the piping multiplied by 1.25 plus
12 inches. The piping shall be bedded in 4 inches of granular fill and then backfilled compacting the side
fillin 6-inch layers on each side of the piping. The compaction shall be to minimum of 85 percent
standard proctor density and extend to a minimum of 6 inches above the top of the pipe.

(Reason: To follow manufacturer backfill requirements and to be clear to Inspectors out in the field.)

**Section 413.4; change to read as follows:

413.4 Required location for floor drains Publiclaundries—and-central-washingfacilities. Floor

drains shall be installed in the following areas:

|_\

In public laundries and in the central washing facilities of multiple family dwellings, the rooms
containing automatic clothes washers shall be provided with floor drains located to readily drain
the entire floor area. Such drains shall have a minimum outlet of not less than 3 inches (76 mm)
in diameter.

[P

Commercial kitchens. In lieu of floor drains in commercial kitchens, the Code Official may accept
floor sinks.

3. Public restrooms.

(Reason: To make more compatible with local health code practices.)

**Section 608.17.5; change to read as follows:

608.17.5 Connections to lawn irrigation systems.

The potable water supply to lawn irrigation systems shall be protected against backflow by an
atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure-type vacuum breaker, a double-check assembly or a
reduced pressure principal backflow preventer. A valve shall not be installed downstream from an
atmospheric vacuum breaker. Where chemicals are introduced into the system, the potable water supply
shall be protected against backflow by a reduced pressure principal backflow preventer.

(Reason: To recognize regional practices.)

Section 703.6; Delete

(Reason: not a standard practice in this region)

North Central Texas Council of Governments 2 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September
2018-Amendments 2048 2021 International Plumbing Code



**Section 704.5; added to read as follows:

704.5 Single stack fittings. Single stack fittings with internal baffle, PVC schedule 40 or cast-iron single
stack shall be designed by a reqgistered engineer and comply to a national recognized standard.

(Reason: to allow owners, installers, inspectors, and design professionals to ready identify product
markers to determine they meet all required standards.)

***Section 712.4.3; add Section 712.4.3 to read as follows:

712.4.3 Dual Pump System. All sumps shall be automatically discharged and, when in any “public use”
occupancy where the sump serves more than 10 fixture units, shall be provided with dual pumps or
ejectors arranged to function independently in case of overload or mechanical failure. For storm drainage
sumps and pumping systems, see Section 1113.

(Reason: To address dual pump system. To provide reference for storm drainage systems.)

**Section 713, 713.1; change to read as follows:

SECTION 713
ENGINEERED COMPUTERIZED DRAINAGE DESIGN

713.1 Design of drainage system. The sizing, design and layout of the drainage system shall be
permitted to-be-designed by a registered engineer using approved eomputer design methods.

(Reason: Code was too restrictive.)

***Section 903.1.1; change to read as follows:

903-1 Roof-extension 903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected. Open vent pipes that extend through a

roof shall terminate not less than six (6) inches (152 mm mm) above the roof Wher&a—reef—rs—te—b%&sed—ﬁeic

(Reason: To provide regional guideline on standard installation method for this area and address
reference number correction.)

**Section 1109; delete this section.

***Section 1202.1; delete Exceptions 1 and 2.

(Reason: State law already specifies that Med Gas systems must comply with NFPA 99.)

END

North Central Texas Council of Governments 3 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September
2018-Amendments 2048 2021 International Plumbing Code



North Central Texas
Council of Governments

Recommended Amendments to the
2021 International Mechanical Code
North Central Texas Council of Governments Region

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Mechanical Code (IMC) are
hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IMC. Underlined type is text inserted. Linred

i - A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an
amendment carried over from the 2018 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised
amendment of the 2021 edition of the code.

Note: Historically the North Central Texas Council of Governments (NCTCOG) has limited Chapter 1
amendments in order to allow each city to insert their local policies and procedures. We now have
suggested certain items to be brought to the attention of cities considering adoption of the code that may
be of concern to several jurisdictions. It is still intended to be discretionary to each city to determine
which Chapter 1 amendments to include.

***Section 102.8; change to read as follows:

102.8 Referenced Codes and Standards. The codes and standards referenced herein shall be those
that are listed in Chapter 15 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this
code shall apply. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards,
each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the adopted amendments.
Any reference to NFPA 70 shall mean the National Electrical Code as adopted.

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced
codes.)

**Section 306.5; change to read as follows:

306.5 Equipment and Appliances on Roofs or Elevated Structures. Where equipment requiring
access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof of a building such that personnel will
have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to access, an interior or exterior means of
access shall be provided._Exterior ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than 12 feet
(2438 mm) to the finish grade or floor level below and shall extend to the equipment and appliances' level
service space. Such access shall . . . {bulk of section to read the same} . . . on roofs having a slope
greater than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). ... {remainder of text unchanged}.

(Reason: To assure access to roof appliances and provide options to not extend exterior ladders to
grade. Consistent with IFGC amendments.)

**Section 306.5.1; change to read as follows:

306.5.1 Sloped Roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans or other components that require service are
installed on a roof having a slope of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) or greater
and having an edge more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at such edge, a catwalk at least 16
inches in width with substantial cleats spaced not more than 16 inches apart shall be provided from the
roof access to a level platform at the appliance. The level platform shall be provided on each side of the
appliance to which access is required for service, repair or maintenance. The platform shall be not less

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote-September2018
Amendments 2018 2021 International Mechanical Code



than 30 inches (762 mm) in any dimension and shall be provided with guards. The guards shall extend
not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the platform, shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage
of a 21-inch-diameter (533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards
specified in the International Building Code...{remainder of text unchanged}.

(Reason: To assure safe access to roof appliances. Consistent with IFGC amendments.)

**Section 501.3; add an exception to read as follows:

501.3 Exhaust Discharge. The air removed by every mechanical exhaust system shall be discharged
outdoors at a point where it will not cause a public nuisance and not less than the distances specified in
Section 501.3.1. The air shall be discharged to a location from which it cannot again be readily drawn in
by a ventilating system. Air shall not be exhausted into an attic, crawl space, or be directed onto
walkways.

Exceptions:

1. Whole-house ventilation-type attic fans shall be permitted to discharge into the attic space of
dwelling units having private attics.

2. Commercial cooking recirculating systems.
3. Where installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and where mechanical or
natural ventilation is otherwise provided in accordance with Chapter 4, listed and labeled

domestic ductless range hoods shall not be required to discharge to the outdoors.

4. Toilet room exhaust ducts may terminate in a warehouse or shop area when infiltration of
outside air is present.

(Reason: Provide a reasonable alternative in areas where a large volume of outside air is present.)

END

North Central Texas Council of Governments 2 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote-September2018
Amendments 2018 2021 International Mechanical Code



North Central Texas
Council of Governments

Recommended Amendments to the
2021 International Fuel Gas Code
North Central Texas Council of Governments Region

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Fuel Gas Code are hereby
amended as follows: Standard type is text from the IFGC. Underlined type is text inserted. Lined-through

i - A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an amendment
carried over from the 2018 edition of the code and a triple asterisk identifies a new or revised amendment
with the 2021 code.

**Section 101.2
{Local amendments to Section 101.2 may be necessary to correspond with the State Plumbing

Licensing Law.}

**Section 102.2; add an exception to read as follows:

Exception: Existing dwelling units shall comply with Section 621.2.

(Reason: Previous code provisions made unvented heater provisions retroactive except as provided for
in local amendment. This amendment and amendment to IFGC 621.2 better clarify what the code
already states: existing systems may stay unless considered unsafe.)

***Section 102.8; change to read as follows:

102.8 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referenced in this code shall be
those that are listed in Chapter 8 and such codes, when specifically adopted, and standards shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Where
differences occur between provisions of this code and the referenced standards, the provisions of this
code shall apply. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and standards,
each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the amendments as well. Any
reference to NFPA 70 or the National Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as adopted.

(Reason: Legal wording to recognize locally adopted codes and amendments adopted with referenced
codes.)

**Section 306.5; change to read as follows:

[M] 306.5 Equipment and Appliances on Roofs or Elevated Structures. Where equipment requiring
access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof of a building such that personnel will
have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above grade to access, an interior or exterior means of
access shall be provided._Exterior ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than 12 feet
(2438 mm) to the finish grade or floor level below and shall extend to the equipment and appliances' level
service space. Such access shall . . . {bulk of section to read the same} . . . on roofs having a slope
greater than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). ... {fremainder of text unchanged}.

(Reason: To assure safe access to roof appliances. Consistent with IMC amendments.)
**Section 306.5.1; change to read as follows:

[M] 306.5.1 Sloped roofs. Where appliances, equipment, fans or other components that require service
are installed on a roof having a slope of 3 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) or greater

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September2018
Amendments 2018 2021 International Fuel Gas Code



and having an edge more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade at such edge, a catwalk at least 16
inches in width with substantial cleats spaced not more than 16 inches apart shall be provided from the
roof access to a level platform at the appliance. The level platform shall be provided on each side of the
appliance to which access is required for service, repair or maintenance. The platform shall be not less
than 30 inches (762 mm) in any dimension and shall be provided with guards. The guards shall extend
not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the platform, shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage
of a 21-inch-diameter (533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards
specified in the International Building Code.

(Reason: To assure safe access to roof appliances. Consistent with IMC amendments.)
**Section 401.5; add a second paragraph to read as follows:
Both ends of each section of medium pressure gas piping shall identify its operating gas pressure with an

approved tag. The tags are to be composed of aluminum or stainless steel and the following wording shall
be stamped into the tag:

"WARNING
1/2 to 5 psi gas pressure
Do Not Remove"

(Reason: To protect homeowners and plumbers.)
**Section 404.12; change to read as follows:

404.12 Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 42 18
inches (305 458 mm) top of pipe below grade, exceptas-provided-forin-Section404-121.

404.12.1 Delete in its entirety.
(Reason: To provide increased protection to piping systems and address reference number change.)
***Section 406.4; change to read as follows:

406.4 Test pressure measurement. Test pressure shall be measured with a monometer or with a
pressure-measuring device designed and calibrated to read, record, or indicate a pressure loss caused
by leakage during the pressure test period. The source of pressure shall be isolated before the pressure
tests are made. Mechanical gauges used to measure test pressures shall have a range such that the
highest end of the scale is not greater than five times the test pressure. Spring type gauges do not meet
the requirement of a calibrated gauge.

(Reason: To require the use of more accurate diaphragm gauges. Spring gauges do not provide
accurate measurement below approximately 17 psig.)

***Section 406.4.1; change to read as follows:

406.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 4+4/2-times-the-proposed
maximum-working-pressure,—but-no-less-than-3 3 psig (20 kPa gauge), or at the discretion of the Code

Official, the piping and valves may be tested at a pressure of at least six (6) inches (152 mm) of mercury,

measured W|th a manometer or slope qauqe mspeehve—ef—desrgn—messu#e—\#he#e—the—test—messu#e

requiring a pressure of 3 psig, diaphragm gauges shall utilize a dlal W|th a minimum diameter of three and

one half inches (3 '%2”), a set hand, 1/10 pound incrementation and pressure range not to exceed 15 psi
for tests requiring a pressure of 3 psig. For tests requiring a pressure of 10 psig, diaphragm gauges shall
utilize a dial with a minimum diameter of three and one-half inches (3 '2"), a set hand, a minimum of 2/10
pound incrementation and a pressure range not to exceed 50 psi. For welded piping, and for piping
carrying gas at pressures in_excess of fourteen (14) inches water column pressure (3.48 kPa) (1/2 psi)
and less than 200 inches of water column pressure (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall not be
less than ten (10) pounds per square inch (69.6 kPa). For piping carrying gas at a pressure that exceeds

North Central Texas Council of Governments 2 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September2018
Amendments 2018 2021 International Fuel Gas Code



200 inches of water column (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall be not less than one and one-half
times the proposed maximum working pressure.

Diaphragm gauges used for testing must display a current calibration and be in good working condition.
The appropriate test must be applied to the diaphragm gauge used for testing.

(Reason: To provide for lesser pressures to coordinate with the use of more accurate diaphragm
gauges.)

**Section 409.1; add Section 409.1.4 to read as follows:

409.1.4 Valves in CSST installations. Shutoff valves installed with corrugated stainless steel (CSST)
piping systems shall be supported with an approved termination fitting, or equivalent support, suitable for
the size of the valves, of adequate strength and quality, and located at intervals so as to prevent or damp
out excessive vibration but in no case greater than 12-inches from the center of the valve. Supports shall
be installed so as not to interfere with the free expansion and contraction of the system's piping, fittings,
and valves between anchors. All valves and supports shall be designed and installed so they will not be
disengaged by movement of the supporting piping.

(Reason: To provide proper security to CSST valves. These standards were established in this region in
1999 when CSST was an emerging technology.)

**Section 410.1; add a second paragraph and exception to read as follows:

Access to regulators shall comply with the requirements for access to appliances as specified in Section
306.

Exception: A passageway or level service space is not required when the requlator is capable of
being serviced and removed through the required attic opening.

(Reason: To require adequate access to requlators.)
**Section 621.2; add exception as follows:

621.2 Prohibited use. One or more unvented room heaters shall not be used as the sole source of
comfort heating in a dwelling unit.

Exception: Existing approved unvented heaters may continue to be used in dwelling units, in
accordance with the code provisions in effect when installed, when approved by the Code Official
unless an unsafe condition is determined to exist as described in Section 108.7.

(Reason: Gives code official discretion.)

END

North Central Texas Council of Governments 3 Approved Month/Year of Board Vote September2018
Amendments 2018 2021 International Fuel Gas Code



North Central Texas
Council of Governments
Recommended Regional Amendments to the
2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code
North Central Texas Council of Governments Region

The following sections, paragraphs, and sentences of the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code
are hereby amended as follows: Standard type is text from the ISPSC. Underlined type is text inserted.
Lined-through-type-is-deleted-text-fromISPSC--A double asterisk at the beginning of a section identifies an
amendment carried over from the 2018 edition of the code. A triple asterisk (***) identifies a new orrevised
amendment with the 2021 ISPSC code.

**Section 102.9; Change to read as follows:

Section 102.9 Other laws. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of
local, state or federal law, to include but not limited to:

1. Texas Department of State Health Services (TDSHS); Standards for Public Pools and Spas;
§285.181 through §285.208, (TDSHS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and
two-family dwellings or townhouses).

2. Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation (TDLR); 2012 Texas Accessibility
Standards (TAS), TAS provide the scoping and technical requirements for accessibility for
Swimming Pool, wading pools and spas and shall comply with 2072 TAS, Section 242.
(TAS rules do not apply to pools serving one- and two-family dwellings or townhouses).

Exception: Elements requlated under Texas Department of Licensing and Requlation
(TDLR) and built in accordance with TDLR approved plans, including any variances or
waivers granted by the TDLR, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements

of this Chapter.

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas statutes which regulate public pools and spas.)

***Section 113.4 Violation penalties; Changed to read as follows:

113.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair a pool or spa in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under
the prOVISIOI’lS of this code may be punishable for each day of the violation set forth by the authority havmq

(Reason: Covered by general provisions of the Code of Ordinances.)
***Section 305; Change to read as follows:

305.1 General.

The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for restricting entry into areas having
pools and spas. In only one-and two-family dwellings and townhouses,-where spas or hot tubs are equipped
with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM F1346 and swimming pools are equipped with a powered
safety cover that complies with ASTM F1346, the areas where those spas, hot tubs or pools are located
shall not be required to comply with Sections 305.2 through 305.7.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 1 Approved (MONTH) 2021
Amendments 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code


https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_91_2010/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch11_PromASTM_RefStdF1346_91_2010/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch03_Sec305.2/995/11715724/text-id-11715782
https://codes.iccsafe.org/premium/document/linkit/ISPSC2018_Ch03_Sec305.7/995/11715724/text-id-11715782

North Central Texas
Council of Governments
(Reason: To clarify requirements for dwellings and commercial properties and specific Texas statutes which
regulate public pools and spas.)

** Add subsection 305.2.7.1; to read as follows:

305.2.7.1 Chain link fencing prohibited. Chain link fencing is not permitted as a barrier in public pools
built after January 1, 1994.

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas Health and Safety Code Chapter 757.003 (f).)
***Section 305.4 structure wall as a barrier; Changes as follows:
305.4 Structure wall as a barrier. Where a wall of a dwelling or structure_of a one- and two-family dwelling

or townhouse or its accessory structure serves as part of a barrier and where doors or windows provide
direct access to the pool or spa through that wall, one of the following shall be required:

Remainder Unchanged
Remainder Unchanged
Remainder Unchanged
Remainder unchanged
Remainder unchanged
Remainder unchanged

onkhwh~

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas Health and Safety Code Chapter 757.007.

**Section 305.6; Change to read as follows:

305.6 Natural barriers ysed in a one- and two-family dwelling or townhouse. In the case where the

pool or spa area abuts the edge of a lake or other natural body of water, public access is not permitted or
allowed along the shoreline, and required barriers extend to and beyond the water's edge a minimum of
eighteen (18) inches, a barrier is not required between the natural body of water shoreline and the pool or
spa.

(Reason: Specific Texas statutes do not allow the use of natural barriers in lieu of fencing for publicpools
per Chapter 757.003).

**Section 307.1.4 Accessibility; Add exception to Section to 307.1.4 as follows:

Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with Architectural Barriers Division of
Texas Department of Licensing and Reqgulation shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements

of this chapter.

(Reason: To accommodate buildings regulated under state law. Further clarified to mean Components that
are specifically addressed by TDLR shall be exempt.)

***Section 307.2.2.2 ; add to read as follows:

Section 307.2.2.2 Location. Depth of the swimming pool and spa shall maintain a ratio of 1:1
from the nearest bunqu foundation or footing of a retalnlnq wall. %@%a*mum@lepm

North Central Texas Council of Governments 2 Approved (MONTH) 2021
Amendments 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code



Exception:

Morth Central Texas
Council of Governments

a sealed engineered design drawing of the proposed new structure shall be submitted for

approval. is required

**Section 310; Change to read as follows:

310.1 General. Suction entrapment avoidance for pools and spas shall be provided in accordance with
APSP 7 (ANSI/PHTA/ICC 7) or for public swimming pools in accordance with State of Texas Rules for
Public Swimming Pools and Spas, Title 25 TAC Chapter 265 Subchapter L, Rule §265.190.

[Remainder unchanged]

(Reason: To clarify specific Texas statutes which regulate public pools and spas.)

** Section 402.12; Change to read as follows:

402.12 Water envelopes. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table
402.12-Texas department of State Health services, Administrative Code Title 25, Chapter 265,

Section 186 (e) and Figqure: 25 TAC 256.186 (e) (6). (Delete Table 402.12 and Figure 402.12)

ADD: Figure: 25 TAC §265.186 (e) (6)
Maximum Diving Board Height Over Water | % Meter 1 Meter 3 Meters

Max. Diving Board Length 12 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft.

Minimum Diving Board Overhang 2ft.6in. 5 ft. 5 ft.

D1 Minimum

8 ft. 6 in. 11 ft. 21in. 12 ft. 21in.

D2 Minimum

9 ft. 10 ft. 10 in. 11 ft. 10 in.

D3 Minimum

4 ft. 6 ft. 6 ft.

L1 Minimum

4 ft. 5 ft. 5 ft.

L2 Minimum

12 ft. 16 ft . 19ft. 9in.

L3 Minimum

14 ft. 10 in. 13 ft . 13 ft. 11in.

L4 Minimum

30 ft. 10 in. 34 ft . 38 ft. 8in.

L5 Minimum

8 ft. 10 ft. 13 ft.

H Minimum

16 ft. 16 ft. 16 ft.

From Plummet to Pool Wall at Side 9 ft. 10 ft. 11 ft. 6 in.

From Plummet to Adjacent Plummet 10 ft. 10 ft. 10 ft.

H (Overhead

Obstruction or Ceiling)

A

2’ 67 Min
=1 Pt A Pt B Pt. C /
° 4’ 6” D2 D
117 Max R 6~ 67 Typical |_/ el
—<730° Max. 10 Vax Slove
|
North Central Texas Council f Governments 3 Approveéi (MONTH) 2021

Amendments

2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code



Morth Central Texas
Council of Governments

" < >< >le >
I.1 1.2 .3 Typical
< L4
4’ Min T
4’ Mll”l< L5 1
10’
l (1 Meter)

(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.)

**Section 411.2.1 & 411.2.2; Change to read as follows:

411 .2.1 Tread dlmensmns and area. Treads shall have a minimum unobstructed horizontal depth (i.e.,

411.2.2 Risers. Risers for steps shall have a maX|mum un|form he|qht of 10 mches with the bottom riser
helqht allowed to taper to zero € ,

(Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.186 (c)(7)(A)& (B).)

**Section 411.5.1 & 411.5.2; Change to read as follows:

411.5.1 Swimouts. Swimouts, located in either the deep or shallow area of a pool, shall comply with all
of the following:

. Unchanged

. Unchanged

. Unchanged

. The leading edge shall be visibly set apart and provided with a horizontal solid or broken stripe at least
1 inch wide on the top surface along the front leading edge of each step. This stripe shall be plainly
visible to persons on the pool deck. The stripe shall be a contrasting color to the background on which
it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall be a slip-resistant surface.

A OWON -

411.5.2 Underwater seats and benches. Underwater seats and benches, whether used alone or in
conjunction with pool stairs, shall comply with all of the following:

1. Unchanged

2. Unchanged

3. Unchanged

4. Unchanged

5. The leading edge shall be visually set apart and provided with a horizontal solid or broken stripe at least

1 inch wide on the top surface along the front leading edge of each step. This stripe shall be.

North Central Texas Council of Governments 4 Approved (MONTH) 2021
Amendments 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code



Morth Central Texas
Council of Governments

plainly visible to persons on the pool deck. The stripe shall be a contrasting color to the background on
which it is applied, and the color shall be permanent in nature and shall be a slip-resistant surface.
6. Unchanged

7. Unchanged

iReason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.184 iui & 265.186 icir 0“

**Section 610.5.1; Change to read:

610.5.1 Uniform height of 9-10 inches. Except for the bottom riser, risers at the centerline shall have a
maximum uniform height of 9-10 inches (229-254 mm). The bottom riser height shall be permitted to vary
from the other risers.

Reason: To avoid conflict with 25 TAC Chapter 265.186 (c)(7)(B).
**Section 804 Diving Water Envelopes; Change to read as follows:
Section 804.1 General. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table 804.1 and

Figure 804.1, or the manufacturer’s specifications, whichever is greater. Negative construction tolerances
shall not be applied to the dimensions of the minimum diving water envelopes given in Table 804.1.

(Reason: To provide minimum standards and to clarify specific manufactures specifications of the diving
equipment.

END

North Central Texas Council of Governments 5 Approved (MONTH) 2021
Amendments 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code



	2021-ISPSC-Amendments - latest.pdf
	Recommended Regional Amendments to the
	**Section 102.9; Change to read as follows:
	***Section 305; Change to read as follows:
	** Add subsection 305.2.7.1; to read as follows:
	***Section 305.4 structure wall as a barrier; Changes as follows:
	305.4 Structure wall as a barrier. Where a wall of a dwelling or structure of a one- and two-family dwelling or townhouse or its accessory structure serves as part of a barrier and where doors or windows provide direct access to the pool or spa throug...
	1. Remainder Unchanged
	2. Remainder Unchanged
	3. Remainder Unchanged
	4. Remainder unchanged
	5. Remainder unchanged
	6. Remainder unchanged
	**Section 305.6; Change to read as follows:
	**Section 307.1.4 Accessibility; Add exception to Section to 307.1.4 as follows:
	**Section 310; Change to read as follows:
	** Section 402.12; Change to read as follows:
	ADD: Figure: 25 TAC §265.186 (e) (6)

	**Section 411.2.1 & 411.2.2; Change to read as follows:
	**Section 411.5.1 & 411.5.2; Change to read as follows:
	**Section 610.5.1; Change to read:
	**Section 804 Diving Water Envelopes; Change to read as follows:
	Section 804.1 General. The minimum diving water envelopes shall be in accordance with Table 804.1 and Figure 804.1, or the manufacturer’s specifications, whichever is greater.  Negative construction tolerances shall not be applied to the dimensions of...
	END

	2021-IPC-Amendments - Final.pdf
	ENGINEERED COMPUTERIZED DRAINAGE DESIGN

	2021-IMC-Amendments - Final.pdf
	2021 International Mechanical Code

	2021-IFGC-Amendments - Final.pdf
	2021 International Fuel Gas Code




