Recommended Amendmentsto the
1997 Uniform Building Code

**Section 209; add a new definition to read as follows:

HIGH-RISE BUILDING is a building having floors used for human occupancy located more
than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

REASON: To provide a definition that did not previoudy exist in the Code.

** Section 214; change definition of “ Mechanical Code’ to read asfollows:

MECHANICAL CODE isthe Uniferm International Mechanical Code™ promutgated-by-the
tnternational-Conference of Buiding Offietals, as adopted by thisjurisdiction.

REASON: To reference NCTCOG's recommended code.

**Section 217; change definition of “ Plumbing Code” to read as follows:

PLUMBING CODE isthe International Plumbing Code™, as adopted by thisjurisdiction.

REASON: To reference NCTCOG's recommended code.

**Section 220; add a new definition for “ Self-Service Storage Facility” .

SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY isreal property desgned and used for the purpose
of renting or leasing individual storage and removing personal property on a self-service badss.

REASON: To provide a definition of a term used in a recommended amendment.

** Section 302.4,Exception #3; changed to read as follows:

3. In the one-hour occupancy separation between Group R, Divison 3 and
Group U Occupancies, the separation may be limited to the installation of not less than
one-half inch gypsum board, or materials approved for one-hour fireresistive
congtruction on the garage sde; and a saf-elesing; tightfitting sehd-woed weather
stripped door 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, or a saéf-elesing—tightfitting door
having a fire-protection rating of not less than 20 minutes when tested in accordance
with Part Il of UBC Standard 7-2, which is a part of this code, is permitted in lieu
...{remainder to read the same}.

REASON: To make the code consistent with the prevailing practice in the region.

97 UBC 1of 34 11/20/97



** Section 305.9; change to read as follows:

305.9 Fire Alarm Systems. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided for Group E Occupancies

with-an-occupanttoad-of 50-or-merepersons. |n Divison 3 Occupancies, system smoke detectors shall
be indalled in all rooms used by children. In Group E Occupancies provided with an ... {remainder of

section unchanged} ...

REASON: To provide a higher level of protection for rooms occupied by children in Group E, Divison
3 occupancies.

**Section 310.9.1.3; add an Exception to read as follows:

Exception: Whenever rewiring or new wiring occurs during the alteration, repair
or addition process that, in the opinion of the Building Official, makes it possble to
hardwire the smoke detectors, then those that can be hardwired shall be installed as
required for new construction.

REASON: To add an exception that encourages the hardwiring of smoke detectors when
circumstances would feasibly allow it.

**Section 310.9.1.4; add a sentence at the end to read as follows:

If, in the opinion of the Building Official, the sounding of one alarm is not loud enough to be heard in all
deeping areas, one or more detectors may be required to be interconnected.

REASON: In very large dwellings, the alarm should alert occupantsin all deeping areas.

**Section 311.2.3.5; changed to read as follows:

311.2.3.5 Vehicle barriers. In parking garages where any parking area is located more than 5 feet
(1524 mm) above the adjacent grade, deck, floor or ramp, vehicle barriers shall be provided.
{remainder of section unchanged}

REASON: To provide additional definition asto when vehicle barriers are required in parking garages.

** Section 403.1; changed to read asfollows:

SECTION 403 -- SPECIAL PROVISIONS FOR GROUP-B—OFHCE-BUH-DINGS-AND
GROUPRDPASION-E HIGH RISE OCCUPANCIES

403.1 Scope. This section applies to all Greup—B—officebuildings—and—Group—R,—Divisen—1
Occupancies, each having floors used for human occupancy located more than 75 55 feet (22-860 16

764 mm) abovethe ... {remainder of paragraph unchanged} ... with Section 403.2 .

Exception: Open parking garages in compliance with Section 311.9.

REASON: Longtime regional amendment — based on equipment available — companion to allow
tradeoffs.

97 UBC 20f 34 11/20/97



**Section 403.2.2, item #2; changed to read as follows:

2. Except for corridors#n netes; and partitions
separating dwelling units or guest rooms, all |nter|or nonbean ng partltlons reqwred to be one-hour fire-
resstive congtruction by Table 6-A may be of non-combustible construction without a fire-resstive time
period. For allowable reduction of corridor construction, see Section 1004.3.4.3.

REASON: Current practice in many citiesin the region.

**Section 403.2.2, item #3; delete.

REASON: To retain arequirement for fire dampers even if an automatic sprinkler system exists.

** Section 403.5.2; add a third paragraph to read as follows:

Actuation of any automatic or manual device shall initiate an alarm signal on the alarming floor,
the floor above, and the floor below and identify on an annunciator the zone or address from which the
dlarm sgnal originated.

REASON: To provide cost savings with a more practical provison.

** Section 403.5.3; changeto read asfollows:

403.5.3 Fire department communication system. A two-way, approved fire department
communication system shall be provided for fire department use. It shall operate between the central
control station and elevators, elevator lobbies, emergency and standby power rooms, fire pump room
and at-entriesinto-enclosed indde stairways at each floor level.

REASON: To expand the areas in which a fire department communication system is located.

**Section 403.7, item #1; add an Exception #4 to read as follows:

4. When corridors are not required to be of fireressive construction under
Section 1004.3.4.3, the elevator lobby is not required.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 503.4.8; add a third paragraph to read as follows:

For one- and two-family dwellings and apartment buildings, open metal carport structures may
be constructed within zero (0) feet of the property line without fire-resistive or opening protection when
the location of such is approved as required by other City ordinances.

REASON: Unreasonable to expect firewall on carports.

97 UBC 30f34 11/20/97



** Section 504.3; change the exceptions to read as follows:

Exceptions: 1. The major occupancy classification of a building may be used to
determine the allowable area of such building when the major use occupies not less than
90 percent of the area of any floor of the a non-sprinklered building, or not less than 80
percent of the area of any floor of a building provided with an automatic sprinkler system
throughout; and provided that other minor accessory uses shall not exceed the basic area
permitted by Table 5-B for such minor uses and that various uses are separated as
specified in Section 302.4.

2. Groups, B, F, M and S and Group H, Divison 5 Occupancies complying with
the provisons of Section 505.2 may contain other occupancies provided that such
occupancies do not occupy more than 10 percent of the area of any floor of a non-
sprinklered building, or not more than 20 percent of the area of any floor of a building
provided with an automatic sprinkler system throughout; nor more than the basic area
permitted in the occupancy by Table 5-B for such occupancy, and further provided that
such occupancies are separated as specified in Section 302.4.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 505.2; add a third paragraph to read as follows:

In other than Group H, Divisons 1, 2 or 3 Occupancies, the area of the following buildings shall not be
limited if the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout as specified
in Chapter 9, and entirely surrounded and adjoined by public ways or yards not less than 60 feet (18 288
mm) in width. The unlimited area provisions of this paragraph cannot be used in conjunction with the
fire-resstive subgtitution provisions of Section 508.

1. Typell-FR buildings.

2. Typell-1hr buildings with five or |ess stories.

3. Typell-N buildings with three or |ess stories.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 505.3; items #1 through #4 are changed to read as follows:
(del ete)

4. SeeHenAQQ,—AtH& Sectlon 505.2 for unllmlted area.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 506; items #1 through #5 of the second paragraph are changed to read as follows:

1. Section 904.2.6 for Group H, Divison 1, 2, 3, 6 and 7 Occupancies.
2. Seetmn%@%iepaprmemeeewranewabtea#e& (delete)

97 UBC 40f 34 11/20/97



4. Section402-Atria Section 505.2 for unlimited area.

5. Section 904.2.7 for Group I, Divisons 1.1 and 1.2 Occupancies used as hospitals, nursing
homes or health-care centers in Type Il One-hour, Type Il One-hour, Type IV or Type V One-hour
construction.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 508 unchanged except item #6 is changed to read as follows:

6. Corridors, except as specifically exempted in Sections 1004.3.4.3 (Sections 1004.3.4.3.1 and
1004.3.4.3.2).

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Table 5-A; insert a footnote #38 to the heading “ EXTERIOR WALLS # and add the footnote to
read as follows:

® When the exterior wall of a non-high-rise building is more than 20 feet from the property line,
the fire-resigtive requirements for exterior bearing and exterior nonbearing walls may be reduced
by one-hour when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system
throughout as specified in Chapter 9. However, a wall that is required to be one-hour may not
be reduced except as allowed under Section 508.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Table 6-A; insert a footnote #4 in building element #38, “ 8. Roofs and roof-ceilings*" and add a
footnote #4 to read as follows:

‘“The fire-resigtive requirements for roofs of non-high-rise buildings may be reduced by one-hour
when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout as
specified in Chapter 9.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Section 708.2.1; add a new sentence to item #4 to read as follows;

For combustion air ducts within dwelling units, see also Section 709.1, Exception to item #1 of the
Mechanical Code.

REASON: To provide additional clarity.

**Section 708.3.1.2.1; change exception #2 to read as follows:

2. Where approved sprinklers are ingtalled within the attic space, draftstopping
may be as specified in the exception to Section 708.3.1.2.2.

97 UBC 50f 34 11/20/97



REASON: To provide additional clarity.

**Section 708.3.1.2.2; change the exception to read as follows:

Exception: Where approved automatic sprinklers are installed within the attic
space, the area between draft stops may be 9,000 square feet (836 nr) and the greatest
horizontal dimension may be 100 feet (30 480 mm).

REASON: To provide additional clarity.

**Section 709.6.1; changed to read as follows:

709.6.1 General. When protection of openings is required, Fhreugh through penetrations of the fire-
resistive walls shall comply ... {remainder of section unchanged} .

REASON: Deemed an unreasonable requirement and continues current prevailing practice in the
region.

**Section 709.7; changed to read asfollows:

709.7 Membrane Penetrations. When protection of openings is required, Membrane membrane
penetrations of the fire-resistive ... {remainder of section unchanged} .

REASON: Deemed an unreasonable requirement and continues current prevailing practice in the
region.

**Section 713.10; item #5 is changed to read as follows:
5. Penetrations of elevator |obbies required by Sections 3002 403.7 and 1004.3.4.5.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Section 713.10; add a fourth paragraph to read as follows:

For dampers in combustion air openings, see also Section 710.2 of the Mechanical Code. For dampers
in use with direct-fired air-heating eguipment, see also Section 915.7 of the Mechanical Code.

REASON: To provide additional clarity and guidance.

**Section 713.11; add a fourth paragraph to read as follows:

For penetrations of ducts conveying hazardous exhausts, see also Section 510.6.4 of the Mechanical
Code. For dampers in combustion air openings, see also Section 710.2 of the Mechanical Code. For
dampersin use with direct-fired air-heating equipment, see also Section 915.7 of the Mechanical Code.

97 UBC 6 of 34 11/20/97



For penetrations of ductsin H-6 Occupancies, see also Section 1202.2.5 of this code.

REASON: To provide additional clarity and guidance.

**Section 902; subitems 1.3, 1.4, 1.5 and 1.6 added to read as follows;

1.3 U.B.C. Standard 9-4, Standard on Aircraft Hangars
1.4 U.B.C. Standard 9-5, | ngallation of Halon Fire Extinguishing System.

1.5 U.B.C. Standard 9-6, Standard for the Ingtallation of Private Fire Service Mains and

Their Appurtenances

1.6 U.B.C. Standard 9-7, I ngtallation of Sprinkler Sysemsin One- and Two-Family

Dwedlings and Manufactured Homes

REASON: To add additional UBC Standards that are used by jurisdictionsin the region.

**Section 904.1.2; changed to read as follows:

904.1.2 Standards. Fire-extinguishing systems shall comply with U.B.C. Standards 9-1, and 9-2, 9-4,

9-5 and 9-6; along with the appropriate National Fire Protection Association Standards.

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Automatic fire-extinguishing systems not covered with
U.B.C. Standard 9-1, er 9-2, 9-4, 9-5 or 9-6 shal be approved and ingalled in
accordance with approved standards.

2. Automatic sprinkler systems may be connected to the domestic water-supply
main when approved by the building official, provided the domestic water supply is of
adequate pressure, capacity and szing for the combined domestic and sprinkler
requirements. In such case, the sprinkler system connection shall be made between the
public water main or meter and the building shutoff valve, and there shall not be
intervening valves or connections. The fire department connection may be omitted when
approved by the fire department.

3. Automatic sprinkler syssemsin Group R Occupancies four stories or |ess may
be in accordance with U.B.C. Standard 9-3.

4. Automatic sprinkler systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and
Manufactured Homes may be in accordance with U.B.C. Standard 9-7.

5. Where sprinklers are ingtalled in dectrical rooms they shall be separated from
the buildings main sprinkler system by a pre-action valve. This valve shall be connected
to fire detection device(s) in the dectrical room. Sprinkler piping shall remain dry until
the fire detection device activates and opens the pre-action valve. Detection devices
shall have a minimum temperature rating of 165 degrees Fahrenheit. Sprinkler head(s)
shall be of a type to remain closed until sufficient heat is present to open them. The
sorinkler(s) shall have a minimum temperature rating of 212 degrees Fahrenheit.
Sprinkler heads in dectrical rooms shall be protected with a listed guard over the head.
Sprinkler heads may be ingtalled in eectrical rooms without the pre-action valve, fire
detection device and guard if approved tamper proof sprinkler heads are ingalled in
place of standard heads.

Water supply as required for such sysems shall be provided in conformance with the supply

7 of 34 11/20/97



requirements of the respective standards; however, every fire protection system shall be designed with a
5 ps margin of safety.

REASON: Documents and standardizes current practicesin the region.

**Section 904.1.3; changeto read asfollows:

904.1.3 Modifications. When residential sprinkler systems as set forth in UBC Standard 9-3 are
provided, exceptions to, or reductions in, code requirements based on the installation of an automatic
fire-extinguishing system are not allowed. Allowable tradeoffs for, or increases in, Building Code
provisions based on the ingtallation of an automatic fire-extinguishing system are not allowed.

Exception: Reductions are allowed for the following provisons:

1. Section 708.3.1.1.3, draft stopsin floor-ceiling assemblies.

2. Section 708.3.1.2.1, draft stopsin attics.

3. Section 708.3.1.2.2, draft stopsin attics.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

OPTION A
**Section 904.2.2; item #5 is changed and items #6 and #7 are added to read as follows:

5. Throughout all buildings with a floor level, other than penthouses in compliance with Section

1511, with-an-eeceupanttoad-of 30-ormere that is located 55 feet (16 764 mm) or more above the
lowest level of fire department vehicle access.
Exception: 1—Airpertecontrol-towers. (delete)
2. Open parking structures in compliance with Section 311.9.
3—Group-F-Divison2 Ocecupancies: (delete)
6. High-Piled Combustible Storage. For any building with a clear height exceeding 15', see
Section 8101 of the Fire Code.
7. Spray Booths and Rooms. New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system as specified in the Fire Code.

OPTIONB
**Section 904.2.2; item #5 is changed and items #6, #7 and #8 are added to read as follows:

5. Throughout all buildings with a floor level, other than penthouses in compliance with Section

1511, with-an-eecupant-toad-of-30-ermere that is located 55 35 feet (26764 10 668 mm) or more
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.
Exception: 1—Airpertecontrol-towers. (delete)
2. Open parking structures in compliance with Section 311.9.
3—Group-F-Divison2 Ocecupancies: (delete)
6. High-Piled Combustible Storage. For any building with a clear height exceeding 15', see
Section 8101 of the Fire Code.
7. Spray Booths and Rooms. New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system as specified in the Fire Code.
8. Buildings Over 6,000 sg.ft. An automatic sprinkler system shall be ingtalled throughout all
buildings over 6,000 sq.ft.

97 UBC 8of 34 11/20/97



Exception: Open parking garages.

REASON: To increase when sprinklers are required which is a companion to sprinkler tradeoffs.

**Section 904.2.6.4; added to read as follows:

904.2.6.4 Group H, Division 5 Occupancies. Aircraft hangers shall be classfied by Group and Type*,
and shall be provided with a fire-extinguishing system as specified by UBC Standard 9-4.

(*Note: Any classification of construction type under UBC Sandard 9-4 shall be for use with
that standard only and shall have no bearing on the construction type used in conjunction with
any other provision of this code.)

REASON: To provide better clarity.

OPTION A
** Section 904.2.9 changed to read as follows:

904.2.9 Group R, Divison 1 Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler sysem shall be ingalled
throughout every apartment house three or more stories in height or containing 16 or more dwelling
units, every congregate residence three or more stories in height or having an occupant load of 20—er
more than 10, and every hotd three or more stories in height or containing 20 or more guest rooms.
Residential or quick-response standard sprinklers shall be used in the dwelling units and guest room
portions of the building.

OPTION B
** Section 904.2.9 changed to read as follows:

904.2.9 Group R, Divison 1 Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler sysem shall be ingalled
throughout every apartment house three two or more stories in height or containing 16 or more
dwelling units, every congregate residence three two or more stories in height or having an occupant
load of 20—er more than 10, and every hotel three two or more stories in height or containing 20 or
more guest rooms. Residential or quick-response standard sprinklers shall be used in the dwelling units
and guest room portions of the building.

REASON: To increase when sprinklers are required which is a companion to sprinkler tradeoffs.

**Sections 904.2.10, 904.2.10.1 and 904.2.10.2; added to read as follows;

904.2.10 Group S Occupancies.

904.2.10.1 Salf-service stor age facility. An automatic sprinkler sysem shall be ingalled throughout all
sdf-service storage facilities.

Exception: One sory sdf-service sorage facilities, that have no interior

97 UBC 90of 34 11/20/97



corridors, with a one-hour fire-rated occupancy separation wall installed between every
storage compartment.

904.2.10.2 Group S, Division 5 Occupancies. Aircraft hangers shall be classfied by Group and
Type*, and shall be provided with a fire-extinguishing system as specified by UBC Standard 9-4.

(*Note: Any classification of construction type under UBC Sandard 9-4 shall be for use with
that standard only and shall have no bearing on the construction type used in conjunction with
any other provision of this code.)

REASON: To provide a reference to the UBC Standard 9-4.

** Section 904.4; subparagraph 4.4 of item #4 is changed to read as follows:

4.4 Other approved fire-protection equipment sueh-aspertable fire-extinguishers-or-Class
H-standpipesareisindalled in such areas.

REASON: To not limit the range of options of fire protection equipment.

** Section 904.5.3; change the third paragraph to read as follows:

There shall be a two-way outlet at-least-one-outlet above the roof line on every standpipe when
the roof has a dope of lessthan 4 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33.3% dope).

Exception: Where the stairway extends to the roof, the two-way outlet may be
located at the topmost floor landing.

REASON: To help ensure adequate fire department access to the outlets.

** Section 904.5.3; add a new paragraph to read as follows:

All Class| standpipes shall be:
1. Water filled at al times, or,
2. Supervised with a minimum of 10 psg and a maximum of 40 psg air pressure with a
high/low alarm.

REASON: To provide provisions to help ensure the readiness and operation of Class| Standpipes.

** Section 906.1;add an Exception #3 to item #1 to read as follows:

3. Buildings protected throughout by an approved automatic sprinkler system.

97 UBC 10 of 34 11/20/97



REASON: To match current prevailing practice in the region.

** Section 906.6.3;add an Exception to read as follows:

Exception: In buildings protected throughout by an approved automatic
sorinkler system, curtain boards need only to extend down from the celing for a
minimum depth of four (4) feet.

REASON: To match current prevailing practice in the region.

**Table 9-A; change Occupancy Item #5, Standpipe Class for sprinklered buildings from “ Ne
requirement” toClass“|”.

REASON: To provide standpipe requirements for those occupancies.

** Section 1004.2.4; change the exception to read as follows:

Exceptions: 1. The separation distance determined in accordance with this section may be
measured along a direct path of exit travel within a corridor serving exit enclosures. The walls of any
such exit enclosure shall not be less than 30 feet (9144 mm), measured in a straight line, from the walls
of another exit enclosure.

2. When the building is provided with an automatic sprinkler system throughout, at least two of
the exits or exit-access doorways shall be placed a distance apart equal to not less than one third of the
length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the area served, in lieu of one half, measured in a
straight line between the center of such exits or exit-access doorways.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Section 1004.2.5.2.3; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

When reduction of corridor congtruction is allowed under Section 1004.3.4.3, the reduction shall not
apply to the corridors of this section for extra travel distance.

REASON: To provide limits on sprinkler tradeoffs.

**Section 1004.2.5.2.5; changed to read as follows:

1004.2.5.2.5 Factory, hazardous and storage occupancies. In a ene-stery building classfied as a
Group H, Divison 5 aircraft repair hangar, or as a Group F or Group S Occupancy, the travel distance
shall not exceed 300 feet (91 440 mm) and may be increased to 400 feet (121 920 mm) if the building is

97 UBC 11 of 34 11/20/97



equipped with an automatic sprinkler system throughout. and-s-alse-previded-with-smoke-and-heat
o fiod . _

REASON: To match current prevailing practice in the region.

|
** Section 1004.2.6; changed to read as follows:

1004.2.6 Dead ends. Where more than one exit or exit-access doorway is required, the exit access
shall be arranged such that there are no dead ends in hallways and corridors more than 20 feet (6096
mm) in length.
Exceptions: 1. In occupancies in Use Group B where the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system, the length of dead-end corridors shall
not exceed 50 feet (15 240 mm).
2. A dead-end corridor shall not be limited in length where the length of the
dead-end corridor islessthan 2.5 times the |east width of the dead-end corridor.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Section 1004.3.4.3; Exceptions#4, 5 and 6 are changed to read as follows:

4. Corridor walls and cerlrngs of Group B Occupancres need not be of fire-
resistive construction w ! eS
the entire story in which the space IS Iooated is equrpped wrth an automatrc sprrnkler
system throughout and an automatic smoke-detection system ingtalled within the
corridor. The actuation of any detector shall activate alarms audible in all areas served
by the corridor.

Use of this exception will not permit the use of non-rated non-protected
congtruction in the following:

-for the exit enclosure separation in exception #1 of Section 1004.2.4.

-to obtain the 100 foot travel distance increase of Section 1004.2.5.2.3.

-to convey air to or from rooms as stated in Section 601.2 of the Mechanical
Code except that private corridors within a single tenant space may be used to
convey air provided that smoke detectors are installed within the tenant corridor
in accordance with their listing.

Groups H, |l and R-1 Occupancrea corrrdors shall not be requrred to be protected when

the building is protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout.

Use of this exception will not permit the use of non-rated non-protected
congtruction in the following:

-for the exit enclosure separation in exception #1 of Section 1004.2.4.
-to obtain the 100 foot travel distance increase of Section 1004.2.5.2.3.
-to convey air to or from rooms as sated in Section 601.2 of the Mechanical

97 UBC 12 of 34 11/20/97



Code.
6. In Group B office buildings efTFypet+—TFype H-FR-and-TFype-H-one-hour

eonstruetion, corridor walls and ceilings need not be of fire-resistive construction within
office spaces of a single tenant when the-entire-stery--whieh the space is teeated-s
equipped with an approved adtormatic—sprinkler—system—and—an—automatic smoke-
detection system is-thstalted within the corridor. The actuation of any detector shall
activate alarms audible in all areas served by the corridor. The smoke-detection system
shall be connected to the building’ s fire alarm system where such a system is provided.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 1004.3.4.5; add Exception #4 to read as follows:

4. When corridors are not required to be of fireressive construction under
Section 1004.3.4.3, the elevator lobby is not required.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

** Section 1005.3.3.7; changed to read as follows:

1005.3.3.7 Pressurized enclosure. In abuilding having a floor level used for human occupancy |ocated
more than 75 55 feet (22860 16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, all
required exit enclosures shall be pressurized in accordance with Section 905 and this section.
Pressurization shall occur automatically upon activation of an approved fire alarm system.

Exceptions: 1. If the building is not equipped with a fire alarm system,
pressurization shall be upon activation of a spot-type smoke detector listed for releasing
service located within 5 feet (1524 mm) of each vestibule entry.

2. Open parking garages in compliance with Section 311.9.

A controlled relief vent capable of discharging a minimum of 2,500 cubic feet per minute (1180 L/s) of
air at the design pressure difference shall be located in the upper portion of such pressurized exit
enclosures.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

**Section 1005.3.3.7.1; changed to read as follows:

1005.3.3.7.1 Vestibules. Pressurized exit enclosures shall be provided with a pressurized entrance
vestibule that complies with the requirements of this section.

Exception: For buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system, vestibules
may be omitted, provided all enclosed exit enclosures are equipped with a barometric
dampered relief opening at the top and the stairway supplied mechanically with sufficient
arr to discharge a minimum of 2,500 cubic feet per minute (1180 L/s) through the relief
opening while maintaining a minimum positive pressure of 0.15-inch water column in the
shaft relative to atmospheric pressure with all doors closed.

Activation of the mechanical equipment shall be initiated by activation of an

97 UBC 13 of 34 11/20/97



approved fire alarm sysem. |f the building is not equipped with a fire alarm system,
pressurization shall be upon activation of a spot-type smoke detector listed for releasing
service located within 5 feet (1524 mm) of each enclosure door. Such equipment shall
also be activated by actuation of the automatic sprinkler system.

REASON: To provide a sprinkler tradeoff to promote installation of automatic sprinkler systems.

|
**Section 1006.3.3.1; changed to read as follows:

1006.3.3.1 General. Exterior exit stairways serving as a portion of the exit discharge in the means of
egress system shall comply with the requirements of Section 1006.3.3. An exterior exit Sairway serves
as an exit discharge component in a means of egress system and is open on not less than two adjacent
sides, except for required structural columns and open-type handrails and guardrails. The adjoining
open ... {remainder of section unchangedy}... for interior stairways.

REASON: Current provison is deemed too strict and unreasonable.

**Section 1101.2; add an item #2 to read as follows:

2. Alternate Design

Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State certified plans, including
any variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the
requirements of this Chapter. State certification of final ingpection must be provided before issuance of
Certificate of Occupancy.

REASON: To provide for coordination with the State.

**Section 1202.2.1; add this exception after the second paragraph to read as follows:

Exception: Bathroom exhaust ducts may terminate in a warehouse or shop area
when infiltration of outside air is present and the duct does not penetrate an occupancy

separation.

REASON: To provide for a more reasonable alternative.

** Section 1203.3; change the exception after the third paragraph to read as follows:

Exception: Private laundry Lapndry rooms in Group R, Divison 3 and indde individua
dwelling units of Group R, Divison 1 Occupancies.

REASON: To provide for a more reasonable alternative.

** Section 1506.3; changeto read asfollows:

1506. 3 Overflow Drams and Scuppers Where roof dral ns are requwed overflow drains havmg%he

97 UBC 14 of 34 11/20/97



oef shall be szed and

mstalled in accordance with Sectlon 1107 of the Plumb| ng Code.

Overflow drains shall discharge to an approved location and shall not be connected to roof drain
lines.

REASON: To coordinate with the sizing requirements found in the plumbing code.

**Table No. 15-A and footnotes changed to read as follows:
*Insert a footnote #5 in the heading “TABLE 15-A - MINIMUM ROOF CLASSES*"

*Change the roof classes for R-3, Types I11-one-hour, 111-N, 1V, V-one-hour and V-N from
113 NR” to 113 C” .

*Delete footnotes 1 and 3.

*Change footnote #4 to read as follows:

er—259—peands{—]:2—2—kg#m2}eﬁerusheelslag When exceedl ng 120 sq.ft. of projected roof area, the roof

class shall be a minimum of Class C or shall be non-combustible.

* Add a footnote #5 to read as follows:

5 All individual replacement shingles or shakes shall be in compliance with the rating required by this
table.

REASON: To match current prevailing practice in the region.

**Section 2501.2; delete.

REASON: Allow inspections at the discretion of each jurisdiction.

** Section 2903; changed to read as follows:
SECTION 2903 -- ALTERNATE NUMBER OF FIXTURES

As an a recommended but not required alternate to the minimum number of plumbing fixtures required
by this chapter See Appendlx Chapter 29 of this code or Table 403 1 of the Plumbl nq Code. When

REASON: To provide recommended, but not required, guidance on the number of fixtures.

**Section 3504, Part 11, Chapter 9; changed to read as follows:

97 UBC 15 of 34 11/20/97



9-1; 307.11.3, 321.1, 403.2, 404.3.1, 405.1.1, 804.1, 902, 904.1.2, 904.1.3, 904.2.6.3, 904.2.7,
904.3.2, 2603.7.1, 2603.8.1
Installation of Sprinkler Systems. Standard for the Ingtallation of Sprinkler Systems, NFPA 13-
1996 1991, National Fire Protection Association.

9-2; 902, 904.1.2,904.5.1
Standpipe Systems.  Standard for Installation of Standpipe Systems and Hose Systems, NFPA
14-1996 1993, National Fire Protection Association.

9-3; 804.1, 805, 902, 904.1.2, 904.1.3, 2603.7.1, 2603.8.1
Ingtallation of Sprinkler Systems in Group R Occupancies Four Stories or Less. Standard for
the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to Four Stories in Height,
NFPA 13R-1996 14989, National Fire Protection Association.

9-4: 902, 904.2.6.4, 904.2.10.2
Aircraft Hangars. Standard on Aircraft Hangars, NFPA 409-1995, National Fire Protection
Association.

9-5: 902, 904.1.2
Halon Fire Extinguishing Sysem. Standard on Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing Systems, NFPA
12A-1992, National Fire Protection Association.

9-6; 902, 904.1.2
Standard for the Ingtallation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their Appurtenances, NFPA 24-
1995, National Fire Protection Association.

9-7: 902, 904.1.2
Ingallation of Sprinkler Sysems in One- Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes,
NFPA 13D-1996, National Fire Protection Association.

REASON: To update the UBC Standards to the most current edition of NFPA Standards.

** Appendix Section 421.1; add an exception to paragraph #1 to read as follows:

Exception: When horizontal members are part of a fence that is at least 6 feet
(1830 mm) in height, the horizontal members need not be on the pool side of the barrier.

REASON: To provide for a more reasonable alternative.

** Appendix Section 1107.4; added to read as follows:

1107.4 Alter nate Design

Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State certified plans, including
any variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the
requirements of this Chapter. State certification of final ingpection must be provided before issuance of
Certificate of Occupancy.

REASON: To provide for coordination with the State.

97 UBC 16 of 34 11/20/97



** Appendix Section 1516.3, subparagraph #1; changed to read as follows:

1. Asphalt shingles. Not more than one twe overlays of asphalt shmgles shall be applled over
an exigti ng asphalt or wood shi ngle roof. .

REASON: Reflectslocal insurance company practices.

97 UBC 17 of 34 11/20/97



**U.B.C. Standard No. 9-1 is changed to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-1
INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

See Sections 307.11.3; 404.3.1; 405.1.1; 405.3.4; 804.1; 902; 904.1.2; 904.1.3;904.2.6.3;
904.2.8; 904.2.9; 2603.7.1; 2603.8.1, Item 4; Appendix 327.2, Uniform Building Code

This standard, with certain exceptions, is based on the National Fire Protection Association
Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, NFPA 13-1996-1991.

Part | of this standard contains the exceptions to NFPA 13-1996.

**Delete all of Part | and Part |1 and replace with a new Part | to read as follows:
Part |
SECTION 9.101 -- AMENDMENTS

The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by this standard applies to the sdlection,
ingtallation, acceptance inspection and acceptance testing of sprinkler systems, except as follows:

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume
| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All references to NFPA 24, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains
and Their Appurtenances, shall be taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-6 of this code.

3. All references to NFPA 409, Standard on Aircraft Hangars, shall be taken to mean
U.B.C. Standard 9-4 of this code.

4. All references to NFPA 70, National Electrical Code, shall be taken to mean the
Electrical Code, as adopted by thisjurisdiction.

5. All referencesto NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One-
and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, shall be taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-
7 of this code.

6. All references to NFPA 13-R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in
Residential Occupancies up to and Including Four Stories in Height, shall be taken to mean
U.B.C. Standard 9-3 of this code.

7. All referencesto NFPA 14, Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems,
shall be taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-2.

8. Sec. 1-1isamended by changing the note to read as follows:

Consult other recognized and accepted standards for additional requirements relating to water
supplies.

9. Sec. 1-4 isamended by changing the definition of “ approved” and “ listed” asfollows:

97 UBC 18 of 34 11/20/97



The definitions of “approved and “listed” shall be as set forth in Volume | of this code.

10. Sec. 1-4.1 is amended by deleting the definitions of the terms “limited combustible
material,” “noncombustible material,” “ should” and “ standard;” by deleting the note following
the definition of “ sprinkler system;” and by adding a definition for “thermal barrier” toread as
follows:

Thermal Barrier is a material that will limit the average temperature rise of the unexposed
surface to not more than 250° F. (121° C.) After 15 minutes of fire exposure complying with nationally
recognized standards.

11. Sec. 1-4.7 isamended to read asfollows:

1.4.7 For the purpose of determining the level of protection to be provided by required sprinkler
sysem ingallations, Table 1.4.7 shall be used.

For hazard classfications other than those indicated, see appropriate nationally recognized
standards for design criteria.

When fire sprinkler systems are required in buildings of undetermined use, they shall be designed
and ingtalled to have a sprinkler dendity of not less than that required for an Ordinary Hazard Group 2
use with a minimum design area of 3,000 square feet (279 nv).

Useis consdered undetermined if not specified at time permit isissued.

Where a subsequent occupancy requires a system with greater capability, it shall be the
responsbility of the occupant to upgrade the system to the required density for the new occupancy.

Other Uniform Codes or standards contain sprinkler system design criteria for Fire control or
suppression of specific hazards.
Table 1.4.7 -- Hazard Classification

Occupancy of Building or Portion Ther eof Hazard
Classification

Group A Occupancies used as meeting rooms, library reading rooms, restaurant seating | Light
areas, clubs, theaters, museums, health clubs, educational classrooms and churches. Group
B Occupancies used as offices, data processing areas, colleges and universities. Group E
Occupancies other than shops and laboratories. Group | Occupancy living and deeping
areas. Group R, Division 1 Occupancies. Typically these uses are such that the quantity
and combugtibility of contentsis such that relatively low-rate-of-heat-release fires would be
expected.

Groups B, F and S Occupancies used for light manufacturing, commercial kitchens, | Ordinary Group 1
laundries, automaobile parking garages, bakeries, canneries, eectronic plants, beverage
manufacturing and glass products manufacturing plants not producing dust or fibers.
Typically these uses are such that the quantity of combugtibles is relatively low, the
combustibility of contentsis moderate, storage does not exceed 8 feet (2438 mm) in height,
and moderate-rate-of-heat-rel ease fires would be expected.

Groups B, F, M and S Occupancies used for chemical plant laboratories, mercantile, | Ordinary Group 2
machine shops, printing, plants, library stack areas, metal working, wood product
assembly, textile manufacturing, confectionery products, cold storage warehouses, cereal
mills, service stations and repair garages. Typically these uses are such that the quantity of

97 UBC 19 of 34 11/20/97



combustibles is moderate. The combugtibility of contents is moderate, storage does not
exceed 12 feet (3658 mm) in height’ and moderate-rate-of-heat-release fires would be
expected.

Also:

Group A Occupancies such as exhibition halls. Group B, F and S Occupancies used as to
tobacco products manufacturing, paper and pulp mills, piers and wharfs, and warehousing®
of higher combustible contents (including packaging). Group H Occupancies used as fee
mills, tire manufacturing, chemical plants, repair garages and woodworking. Group H,
Divison 6 Occupancies (except extra-hazard areas). Typically these uses are such that
high-rate-of-heat-rel ease fires would be expected and the spread of fire would be rapid.

Group H Occupancies used for printing [using inks with flash points below 100° F. (38°
C)], combustible hydraulic fluid-use areas such as die casting and metal extruding,
upholstering with plastic foam, rubber reclaiming, compounding, drying, milling,
vulcanizing, plywood and particle board manufacturing, saw mills, textile picking,
opening, blending, garnetting, carding and combining of cotton, synthetics, wool shoddy or
burlap. Typically these uses are such that a significant fire hazard exists.

Extra Hazard
Group 1

Group H Occupancies used as asphalt saturating, flammable liquids spraying, flow coating,
open oil quenching, varnish and paint dipping, solvent cleaning, and manufactured home
or modular building manufacturing (where the finished building enclosure is present and
has combustible interiors). These uses are such that a severe fire hazard exists.

Extra Hazard
Group 2°

! See also Section 5-3.2

2 For high-piled storage, see Article 81 of the Fire Code.

3 For additional or more stringent criteria, see Article 79 or 80 of the Fire Code.
12. Sec. 2-1.1isrevised to read asfollows:
2-1.1 All materials and devices shall be listed and approved.

13. Sec. 2-3.5isrevised to read as follows;

2-3.5 Other types of pipe or tube, such as plagtic, may be used if it is investigated and found to

be lised for this service.

14. Sec. 2-8.1isrevised to read as follows;

2-8.1 The fire department connection(s) shall be internal swivel fittings having national standard

hose thread or as approved by the chief.

15. Sec. 2-9.1 isrevised by changing the last line as follows: “ on the premises within two

minutes after such flow begins.”

16. Sec. 2-9.5.1 isrevised to read as follows;

Electrically operated alarm attachments forming part of an auxiliary, proprietary, remote station

or local sgnaling system shall be ingtalled in accordance with Fire Code Standard No. 14-1.

17. Sec. 3-9.1isrevised by deleting the last sentence.

18. Sec. 4-2isrevised by changing the last item to read asfollows:

Storage - High-piled storage (as defined in the Fire Code) -- 40,000 square feet (3716 nv).

(Exception to remain unchanged.)

97 UBC 20 of 34




19. Sec. 4-6.4.1.2 isrevised by changing Exception 3 to read asfollows:

Exception No. 3: Where sprinklers are installed under composite wood joists less than 16
inches (406 mm) in depth, sprinkler deflectors shall be a minimum of 1 inch (25 mm) and a maximum
of 6 inches (152 mm) below the bottom of the composite wood joist and the joist channels shall e fire
stopped the full depth of the joist with a material equivalent to the web construction so that individual
channel areas do not exceed 300 square feet (27.9 n¥). Where the depth of the composite wood joist is
16 inches (406 mm) or greater, protection shall be provided by using one or more of the following
methods:

(a) Provide a sprinkler in each joist channel. The distance between sprinklers within the joist
channel shall not exceed 15 feet (4572 mm).

(b) Protect the composite wood joist with 5/8-inch (16 mm) Type X gypsum wallboard attached
directly to the bottom of the composite wood joist. Joist channels shall be fire-stopped the full depth of
the joist with a material equivalent to the web construction so that the volume of individual channels
do not exceed 160 cubic feet (4.53 n7).

(c) Completely fill the channel with noncombustible insulation. The insulation shall be secured
to prevent the insulation from falling. Joist channels shall be fire-stopped the full depth of the joist
with a material equivalent to the web construction so that the volume of individual channels does not
exceed 160 cubic feet (4.53 ).

20. Sec. 4-14.2.1.2 isrevised to read as follows:

When sprinkler piping isingtalled in storage racks as defined in Fire Code Standard 81-2, piping shall be
substantially supported from the storage rack structure or building in accordance with all applicable
provisions of Sections4-14.2 and 4-14.4.3.

21. Sec. 4-15.1.1.1isrevised toread asfollows:

Local water-flow alarms shall be provided on each sprinkler system having more than five sprinklers and
shall be located in an area approved by the Chief.

22. Sec5-2.3.1.1isrevised by substituting “ nationally recognized” for “NFPA” in thefirst
line of Exception 1.

23. Sec. 5-34.1 is revised by substituting “ nationally recognized” for “NFPA” in the
second line of the text.

24. Sec. 6-1.1.1(I) isrevised to read asfollows:

6-1.1.1(1) Manufacturing data sheets for sprinkler head which contain at least the following information:
-Make
-Type
-K-factor
-Nominal office 5ze
-Temperature rating
-Minimum operating pressures and discharge rates for proposed area of coverage.

25. Sec. 8-4.1isrevised to read asfollows:

8-4.1 The ingaller of the system shall provide the owner with written instructions and information
relating to the care and maintenance of the sprinkler system, with special attention given to the sprinkler

97 UBC 21 of 34 11/20/97



system devices.
Subsections (a) and (b) are deleted.

26. Chapter 9isdeleted.
27. Sec. 10-1.1 isrevised to read asfollows:

10-1.1 A sprinkler system ingtalled under this standard shall be maintained in accordance with Article 10
of the Fire Code.

28. Chapter 11 isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

**U.B.C. Standard No. 9-2 is changed to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-2
STANDPIPE SYSTEMS

See Sections 902, 904.1.2 and 904.5.1, Uniform Building Code

This standard, with certain exceptions, is based on the National Fire Protection Association
Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems, NFPA 14-1996 1993.

Part | of th|s standard contaj ns exceptlons to NFPA 14 1996 4:993 ParPH%HhrsstandaFeLeemams

Unless specifically adopted € sawhere, supplemental standards referenced in this primary standard shall
only be considered to be guidance material subject to the approval of the authority having jurisdiction

hoilcine cfficial

**Delete all of Part | and Part |1 and replace with a new Part | to read as follows:
Part |
SECTION 9.201 -- AMENDMENTS
1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume

| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All referencesto NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, shall be
taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-1 of this code.

97 UBC 22 of 34 11/20/97



3. All referencesto NFPA 24, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains
and Their Appurtenances, shall be taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-6 of this code.

4. Sec. 3-2.4 isrevised to read asfollows:

3-2.4 Manual - Dry. A manual-dry standpipe system shall be a dry standpipe system that does
not have a permanent water supply attached to the system. Manual-dry systems need water from afire
department pumper (or the like) to be pumped into the system through the fire department connection
in order to supply the system demand. Manual-Dry standpipe systems may not be installed except in
areas subject to freezing and with the approval of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

5. Sec. 3-3.1isrevised to read asfollows:

3-3.1Class| Systems. A Class| standpipe system shall provide 2-1/2 in. (63.5-mm) hose
connections to supply water for use by fire departments and those trained in handling heavy fire streams.

All Class | standpipes systems shall be:
1. Water filled at all times; or,
2. Supervised with a minimum of 10 psig and a maximum of 40 psg air pressure
with a high/low alarm.

6. Sec. 5-3.2(f) isrevised to read asfollows:

(f) Where the most remote portion of a nonsprinklered floor or story islocated in excess of 150
ft (45.7 m) of travel distance from a required exit or closest point of approved fire department access,
or the most remote portion of a sprinklered floor or story islocated in excess of 200 ft (62 m) of travel
distance from arequired exit, or closest point of approved fire department access, additional hose
connections shall be provided, in approved locations, where required by the local fire department.

7. Sec. 5-7(a) isrevised by adding a second exception to read asfollows:
Exception No. 2: Standpipe systems that are a portion of an approved sprinkler system may utilize a
Fire Department pumper in operation at the Fire Department connection to meet the 100 psi hydraulic
calculation requirements, subject to the approval of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

8. Sec. 5-9.1.1isrevised by adding a second exception to read as follows:
Exception No. 2: In all fully sprinklered buildings, except high rises, the flow rate requirement of 500
GPM for the most remote standpipe, and 250 GPM for additional standpipes may be calculated
utilizng a Fire Department pumper in operation at the systems Fire Department connection, subject to
the approval of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

9. Chapter 10 isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

97 UBC 23 0of 34 11/20/97



97 UBC 24 of 34 11/20/97



**U.B.C. Standard No. 9-3 ischanged to read as follows:
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-3
INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER SYSTEMSIN
GROUP R OCCUPANCIESFOUR STORIESOR LESS

See Sections 804.1, 805, 902, 904.1.2, 2603.7.1 and 2603.8.1,
Uniform Building Code

**Delete all of Part | and Part |1 and replace with a new Part | to read as follows:
Part |

SECTION 9.301 -- ADOPTION OF NFPA STANDARD
Except for the limitations, deletions, modifications and amendments set forth in Section 9.302 of this
sandard, the ingallation of sprinkler systemsin Group R Occupancies required by this code shall bein
accordance with the Standard for the Ingtallation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies,
NFPA 13R-1996, or U.B.C. Standard 9-1.
SECTION 9.302 -- AMENDMENTS
The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by Section 9.301 applies to the sdlection,
ingtallation, acceptance ingpection and acceptance testing of sprinkler systems in resdential occupancies
four stories or less, except asfollows:

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume

| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All references to NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler System, shall be
taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-1 of this code.

3. Sec. 1-3isamended as follows:

The definitions of “ approved” and “listed” shall be as set forth in Volume 1 of this code.
The definitions of “ should” and “ standard” are deleted.

The definition of “ residential occupancies’ isrevised asfollows:

RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES are Group R Occupancies.

4. Sec. 2-3.2 isrevised by changing the reference to “ NFPA 20 and 22" to “ nationally

recognized standards’ .

97 UBC 25 of 34 11/20/97



5. Secs. 2-7.1 and 2-7.2 are added as follows;

2-7.1 A sprinkler system ingtalled under this standard shall be maintained in accordance with the
Fire Code.

2-7.2 The ingaller of the sysem shall provide the owner with written instructions and
information relating to the care and maintenance of the sprinkler system, with special attention given to
the sprinkler system devices.

6. Chapter 3isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

**J.B.C. Standard No. 9-4 added to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-4
STANDARD ON AIRCRAFT HANGARS

See Section 902.1.3, 904.1.2, 904.2.6.4 and 904.2.10.2
Uniform Building Code

SECTION 9.401 -- ADOPTION OF NFPA STANDARD

Except for the limitations, deletions, modifications and amendments set forth in Section 9.402 of this
sandard, the ingtallation of fire-extinguishing systems in aircraft hangars of Group H, Divison 5 and
Group S, Divison 5 Occupancies required by this code shall be in accordance with the Standard on
Aircraft Hangars, NFPA 409-1995.

SECTION 9.402 -- AMENDMENTS

The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by Section 9.401 applies to the salection,
installation, acceptance inspection and acceptance testing of fire-extinguishing systems in aircraft
hangars of Group H, Divison 5 and Group S, Divison 5 Occupancies, except as follows:

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume
| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All references to NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler System, shall be
taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-1 of this code.

3. All references to NFPA 70, National Electrical Code, shall be taken to mean the
Electrical Code, as adopted by thisjurisdiction.

97 UBC 26 of 34 11/20/97



4. Sec. 1-3isamended asfollows:
The definition of “ Fire Wall” isrevised asfollows:
FireWall. A wall separating buildings or subdividing a building to prevent the spread of fire

and having a fire resistance rating as required for an area separation wall as listed in Volume | of this
code and structural gtability.

The definition of “ Hangar Building Cluster” isrevised asfollows:

Hangar Building Cluster. A group of buildings with more than one area for the storage and
servicing of aircraft and all attached or contiguous structures, or structures not separated as specified in
Volume | of this code 2-3-2-6r-5-2.1-of this standard, as appropriate.

The definition of “ Single Hangar Building” isrevised asfollows:

Single Hangar Building. A building with one area for the storage and servicing of aircraft and
any attached, adjoining, or contiguous structure, such as a lean-to, shop area, or parts storage area not
separated as specified in Volume | of this code 2-3-2-er5-2-1-of thisstandard, as appropriate.

5. Sec. 2-1.1 isamended asfollows:

2-1.1* Group | and Il hangars shall be assgned a congruction type, and constructed, in accordance
with the provisions of Volume | of this code. However, for the purpose of using this standard, Group |
hangars shall be either Type | or Type Il congruction in accordance with NFPA 220, Sandard on
Types of Building Construction. For the purpose of using this standard, Group Il hangars shall be
constructed of any of the types of construction specified in NFPA 220, Sandard on Types of Building
Construction, or any combination thereof.

6. Sec. 2-1.2 isamended as follows;

2-1.2* Mezzanines, tool rooms, and other enclosures within aircraft storage and servicing areas shall be
constructed of neneembuselete materlal as specmed in Volume | of this code er—#mrteel—eembusebte

7. Sec. 2-2.1 isamended as follows;

2-2.1* Where aircraft storage and servicing areas are subdivided into separate fire areas, the separation
shaII be by an area separatlon waII with openl ng protectlon as deflned in Volume | of this code ernre

8. Sec. 2-2.3isamended asfollows:

97 UBC 27 of 34 11/20/97



2-2.3* Partitions and ceilings separating aircraft storage and servicing areas from all other areas, shops,
offices, and parts storage areas shall be fi rerated when and as reqw redi in Volume| of this code haveat

9. Sec. 2-2.4isamended asfollows:
2-2.4 Where a storage and servicing area has an attached, adjoining, or continuous structure, such as a
lean-to, shop, office, or parts storage area, the wall common to both areas shall be flrerated when and
as required |n Vqume | of thls code have-al A 6

10. Sec. 2-3.1 isamended as follows;

2-3.1 Precautions shall be taken to ensure ready access to hangars from all sdes. Adeguate separation
and firerating of exterior walls, as required by Volume | of this code for buildings on the same
property, shall be provided to reduce fire exposure between buildings. The clear yards between

buildings spaces-specified-in—Tables2-3.2-and-2-3.3 shall not be used for the storage or parking of

aircraft or concentrations of combustible materials, nor shall buildings of any type be erected therein.

11. Sec. 2-3.2 isdeleted.

12. Table 2-3.2 isdeleted.
13. Sec. 2-3.2.1 isdeleted.
14. Sec. 2-3.2.2 isdeleted.
15. Sec. 2-3.2.3 isdeleted.
16. Sec. 2-3.3 isdeleted.

17. Table 2-3.3 isdeleted.
18. Sec. 2-3.3.1 isdeleted.
19. Sec. 2-3.3.2 isdeleted.

20. Sec. 2-4.3 isamended asfollows:

2-4.3 Floor openings in multistoried sections of hangars shall be enclosed with partitions or protected
with constructl on when and as required bv Volume I of thls code havmgaﬂrera&aneemﬂngnm

22. Sec. 2-5.2 isdeleted.
23. Sec. 2-5.3 isddleted.
24. Sec. 2-5.4 isdeleted.

97 UBC 28 of 34 11/20/97



25. Sec. 2-6.1 isamended asfollows:

2-6.1 In aircraft storage and servicing areas of hangars heusng-etherthan-unfueled-aireraft, column
protection shall be required when and as required by Volume | of this code ir-aceordance-with-2-6-2

through 2-6.4.

26. Sec. 2-6.2 isdeleted.

27. Sec. 2-10.1 isamended asfollows:

2-10.1 Exposed mterror msulatr on attached to walls and roofs inan arrcraft storage and servicing area
of a hangar ne , , nee-Ww
thrsstandard—asappheabte shall be as soecrfred in Vqume I of thrs code neneembustrbteaseleﬁhedrm

28. Sec. 2-10.2 is deleted.

29. Sec. 2-12.1 isamended asfollows:

2-12.1* Heating, ventilating, and air conditioning equipment shall be ingalled, as applicable, in
aocordance wrth the Mechanrcal Code and Volume I of thrs code NFPA—QGA%andard—fer—the

30. Sec. 2-12.3 isamended asfollows:

2-12.3 In aircraft storage and servicing areas of hangars heusing-etherthan-unfueled-aireraft, hangar
heating plants that are fired with gas, liquid, or solid fuels not covered under 2-12.5 of this section and

that are not located in a detached building shall be Iocated in a room constructed as requrred in the
Mechanical Code and Volume | of this code-s :

having-at-teast—a-1-heurfire res stance rating. Thrs separated room shall not be u%d for any other

hazardous purpose of combustr bIe storage

31. Sec. 2-12.6 isamended as follows:

2-12.6 Where a mechanical ventilating system is employed in hangars or shops, the ventilating system
shall be ingalled in accordance with the Mechanical Code NFPA-90A-Sandard-for-the thstaltation-of

Ail-Conditioning-and-\Ventiating-Systems.
32. Sec. 2-12.7 isamended asfollows:

97 UBC 29 of 34 11/20/97



2-12.7 Where blower and exhaust systems are installed for vapor removal the systems shaII be mstalled
in accordance with the Mechanical Code N ) ndal /ey
Matertals.

33. Sec. 2-13.3 isamended asfollows:

2-13.3 In aircraft storage and servicing areas of hangars heusihg-ether—than—unfueled-—aireraft, main
distribution panels, metering equipment, and smilar eectrical equipment shall be located in a room

separated from the aircraft storage and serV|C| ng areas when and as requwed bv the Electncal Code and
Volume | of this code by , . »

34. Sec. 2-16.1 isamended asfollows:

2-16.1 Means of egress from the aircraft hangar shall comply with the provisons of Volume | of this

code NFPA-101,-Life Safety Code.

35. Sec. 2-17 isamended asfollows:

2-17* Materials for Draft Curtains. Where prowded draft curtalns shall be constructed as re_quwed
in Volume | of thls code 6 . '

36. Sec. 5-1.1 isamended asfollows:

5-1.1* Group Il hangars shall be assigned a construction type, and constructed, in accordance with the
provisons of Volume | of this code. However, for the purpose of using this standard, Group |11
hangars shall be constructed of any of the types of construction specified in NFPA 220, Sandard on
Types of Building Construction.

37. Sec. 5-1.6 isamended asfollows:

5-1.6 Roof covenngs shall be as reqwred in Volume | of thls code hstedraerLas&&eebet{eHAmeFe

38. Sec. 5-1.7 isamended asfollows:

5-1.7 Exposed interior insulation attached to walls and roofsm alrcraft storage and servicing areas shall
beasspedfledln Volumel of this code nenecem ' , nda e

97 UBC 30 of 34 11/20/97



39. Sec. 5-2.1isdeleted.
40. Table5-2.1 isdeleted.
41. Sec. 5-2.2 isdeleted.

42. Sec. 5-2.3 isamended asfollows:

5-2.3 Partitions and ceilings separating aircraft storage and servicing areas from other areas, such as
shops, offices, and parts storage ar shall beflrerated when and mstalled as, requwed by Volume I
of thIS code hav . with-0

43. Sec. 5-3.3 isdeleted.

44, Table5-3.3isdeleted.

45. Sec. 5-4.1 isamended asfollows:

5-4.1 Heating, ventilation, and air conditioning equipment shall be ingtalled, as applicable, in accordance
with the Mechanlcal Code and Volume I of thls code NFPA—QQA%andaFd—feHhaﬂstaHatrenef—Aw

46. Sec. 5-4.3 isamended asfollows:

5-4.3 Hangar heating plants that are fired with gas, liquid, or solid fuels not covered under 5-4.5 of this
section, and that are not located in a detached building, shall be located in a room constructed as

required by the Mechanical Code and Volume | of this code separated-from-otherparts-of-the-hangar-by

eongtruetion-having-at-teasta-1-hourfire resistance rating.  This separated room shall not be used for
any other hazardous purpose or combustl bIe storage andeqau—havenee#eeeaee&#emtheawetaft

47. Sec. 5-4.6 isamended as follows;

5-4.6 Where a mechanical ventilating system is employed in hangars or shops, the ventilating system
shall be ingalled in accordance with the Mechanical Code NFPA-90A-Sandard-for-the thstalation-of

AH—Conditioningand-\entHating-Systems, and in accordance with the applicable provisons of Section
5-4 of this chapter.

48. Sec. 5-4.7 isamended asfollows:

5-4.7 Where blower and exhaust systems are ingtalled for vapor removal the systems shaII be mstalled
in accordance with the Mechanical Code N ) ndal /ey
Matertals.

97 UBC 31 0of 34 11/20/97



49. Sec. 5-8.1 isamended asfollows:

5-8.1 Means of egress from the aircraft hangar shall comply with the provisons of Volume | of this

code NFPA-101Life Safety Code.

50. Chapter 7 isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

]
**J.B.C. Standard 9-5 added to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-5
INSTALLATION OF HALON 1301 FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS

See Section 902.1.4, Uniform Building Code

SECTION 9.501 - ADOPTION OF NFPA STANDARD

Except for the limitations, deletions, modifications or amendments set forth in Section 9.502 of this
gandard, the ingallation of Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing Systems required by this code shall be in
accordance with the “ Standard on Halon 1301 Fire Extinquishing Systems, NFPA 12A- 1992.

SECTION 9.502 - AMENDMENTS

The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by Section 9.501 applies to the salection,
ingtallation, acceptance ingpection and acceptance testing of Halon 1301 Fire Extinquishing Systems,
except asfollows:

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume
| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All references to NFPA 70, National Electrical Code, shall be taken to mean the
Electrical Code, as adopted by thisjurisdiction.

3. Chapter 5isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

**J.B.C. Standard No. 9-6; added to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-6
INSTALLATION OF PRIVATE FIRE SERVICE MAINS
AND THEIR APPURTENANCES

See Section 902.1.5, Uniform Building Code

SECTION 9.601 - ADOPTION OF NFPA STANDARD

97 UBC 32 0of 34 11/20/97



Except for the limitations, deletions, modifications or amendments set forth in Section 9.602 of this
standard, the ingtallation of private fire service mains and their appurtenances required by this code shall
be in accordance with the “ Standard for the Ingallation of Private Fire Service Mainsand Their
Appurtenances, NFPA 24-1995.

SECTION 9.602 - AMENDMENTS

The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by Section 9.601 appliesto the selection,
installation, inspection, maintenance and testing of private fire service mains and their appurtenances,
except asfollows.

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume
| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All referencesto NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler System, shall be
taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-1 of this code.

3. Sec. 1-1.1 isadded asfollows:

1-1.1 Other codes. When connecting to a potable water supply, other codes and provisions, such as
those for the prevention of backflow, may also apply. When the fire service main is also used for
potable water supply, other codes and provisions, which may include additional permits, ingtallation
requirements and separate inspections from other AHJ departments, may also apply.

4. Chapter 10 isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

**J.B.C. Standard No. 9-7; added to read as follows:

UNIFORM BUILDING CODE STANDARD 9-7
SPRINKLER SYSTEMSIN ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGSAND MANUFACTURED HOMES

See Section 902.1.6, Uniform Building Code
SECTION 9.701 - ADOPTION OF NFPA STANDARD

Except for the limitations, deletions, modifications or amendments set forth in Section 9.702 of this
standard, the installation of sprinkler syssemsin one- and two-family dwellings and manufactured homes
required by this code shall be in accordance with the “ Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems
in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, NFPA 13D-1996.

SECTION 9.702 - AMENDMENTS

The National Fire Protection Association standard adopted by Section 9.701 applies to the selection,
ingtallation, inspection, maintenance and testing of sprinkler systemsin one- and two-family dwellings
and manufactured homes, except as follows:

1. Any standard referenced in this document that has not specifically been adopted may
be replaced with other nationally recognized standards, or with adopted provisions from Volume
| of thiscode or from the Fire Code, by the authority having jurisdiction.

2. All referencesto NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler System, shall be

97 UBC 330f 34 11/20/97



taken to mean U.B.C. Standard 9-1 of this code.
3. All referencesto NFPA 13-R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systemsin

Residential Occupancies up to and Including Four Storiesin Height, shall be taken to mean
U.B.C. Standard 9-3 of this code.

4. Chapter 6 isdeleted.

REASON: To make the most current NFPA Standard compatible with the 1997 UBC and prevailing
practice in thisregion.

END

97 UBC 34 of 34 11/20/97



